Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KI/TV(N)/634/2018-20

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2020

CHOG NIV

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

@1 QUMD a0, 2020 2)062! 03
oalas 03rd July 2020
?/D'Ia'cls;g 28 1195 efloymo 19 m“,\’fc? 1658
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, 19th Mithunam 1195
Friday 1942 @RI 12
12th Ashadha 1942
CHO8 MVABHHID
wl@a (Plwa Mldanrem-ail) aidia ]
all22emoalmo
M 9559/6e165.m512/2020/@no. @)D fy@o, 2020 23300021 3
1195 alinymo 19

1942 @rpatouso 12.

2020 =y06e1 3-00 WG] 6508 NAIBENA Qll8oeNIN6) SO @IS alO@YIM

&3IMMM aldmERMEBRReS @0lNIERIEe W] H@IMIM (IMIlELE S},

NAIBERROIOS DOMOQIMB (18000,

@poallas enioenyy all. &&s.,
M@z &avEs50l.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2020-9e1 37-20 MMIA 6323l

2020-0£1 608 DM, 303QU8S], @ ©®I¥1e108] Bx:UAMIW] (6BEWG)

a0l

0™ OloJeRlesllon ag)$lelOBIOIMI0  MVLAICTLOCTHIT GHO8 WAUABGNA

Qilgoenioee ]SO @).

1998-6£1 808 DQ, BI53AUSS], O H®I¥IEI08] ceUAMIW] BB

6RAVDI aIgRMO®IMI8s
&0}
a303lonad S

afl0le,.—1998-0e1 65,08 HVQ, &OSIAUSS], O 6®IFIENS] HUAMIUW] VLY
(1998-021 17) O@IMIEUDAHO HIEMIIM  @DYQIUDIEERUIEBNID]  BRRVDI  2IQRMM @)

QIBMAODI0]H6HH@ILN0;

GHO8 MLoMUOOM MIATVE  AVEMSMOMILIPOOD@IMILR  @OM AV
MNSalSIOWSIEHNMEDT  @YAUUDIMISAN  MIa0alOIEERUd  mlelaileneememy 6508

NQIRERABHS BeNIOELINODIBlBNM@IMOLI}0;

06000, @O@IMIM, EGIOOOMIONNG  BOEMALISN@IHS  213-00  BOMIGIG0
(1)-090 QUMD(EIMHI00 MBS BPWIB0068308 allrleworils] 608 WA

9690 |0 SAAWIMMY Qil80enIne)e |SIoYmIIMI—

1. 21)0}89Be |00 (@I000EARe.—(1) Y addllmmmilay 2020-0e1 6208 OQ,

035188], ®¢ 6®o¥1e1n8] eunmIW] (6REVTI) SoBAWIMMBAY o) Gald alO@Jo.
(2) D@ 9SMB (@IVNILIODIE QUM DIE).

2. 1998-0£1 17-00 @YBQ @I HILBHMOVI] BEENGI .21 |ESENZMIEM.—EDD

aodulmmday mlelailellcleosym  @oeio) 1998-ee1 6508 DY, &IFUSS], @

0®2%1e108] MW G@:dlay (1998-ee1 17) (D@IMEUdaHo (IWIM BY)EY ag)aNIET)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




a10003UBlE66)e|Sid:) 3-00 AU} I@B a1000dUDljldleemm 6EENDIB:udHs) aillecwmows]

(@1oenIelmIeN30@lBleeM 6.

3. 4-00 QU lM88 EREUNTI.—(EIWIM BYB:FleR! 4-00 Qlds)q fl@d,—

(1) (1)-00 2alQB @ “EIDIMOMo oB¥ ©3atd Aflo” ag)M QILSEUDH6)

ald0o “E@IMDOMo al®lMera] 03ald Afl™mo” ag)iM QAIOBIB:UB BaIBBHHENZ®IENY;

(2) (2)-00 92101 l@D “630600 MOAVAIY0 aBS OJad” ag)IN QAUIBEBGUBHE)  ald@o

“630600 MO0 al®IMer®] 0lal” ag)IM QAUIBOBUD BalBCHNENZMIEN);

(3) (3)-00 9alIB{l@d “630600 MOV @S BYad Afl@o” ag)IM QAI0HEB:UDHE)

ald0o “60600 MMV al®IMe®T 0ol Afl®o” ag)dN QAUDEBUD BalBEHHENBMIEN);

(4) @-00 901Gl “G.LOBRIWOBIN GIEIMOW &V} OB  ag)M
QUOBNGUBHE) ald:0o “BoUIRIROMING af)9alOTIErR] LOMAIMOMIM LRI

MID” af)M QAUIBNHUD Bal@CHENZMIE).

@Olay MNMNE IO,
DQUICGPD.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION

No. 9559/Leg. C2/2020/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 3rd July, 2020

19th Mithunam,1195
12th Ashadha, 1942.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in
English language of the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (37 of 2020).

By order of the Governor,

ARAVINTHA BABUP. K.,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




[Translation in English of “2020-ee1 6808 0Q, $030I88], @¢ ©®Islens]
eaHamIW] (6cEL®I) BadIMadMY” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 37 OF 2020

THE KERALA BAMBOO, KATTUVALLI AND PANDANUS LEAF WORKERS’
WELFARE FUND (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India.

AN

ORDINANCE

to amend the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act, 1998.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient to amend the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and
Pandanus Leaf Workers' Welfare Fund Act, 1998 (17 of 1998) for the purposes hereinafter

appearing;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session, and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to

take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following

Ordinance:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala

Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.
(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Act 17 of 1998 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Bamboo, Kattuvalli and Pandanus Leaf Workers’ Welfare Fund Act,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




1998 (17 of 1998) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) shall have effect subject to the

amendments specified in section 3.
3. Amendment of section 4—1In the principal Act, in section 4,—

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (2), for the words “seven rupees per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees per month” shall be substituted;

(3) in sub-section (3), for the words “seven rupees each per month”, the words “fifteen

rupees each per month” shall be substituted;

(4) in sub-section (4), for the words “an amount equal to the amount contributed”, the
words “an amount equal to the seventy five percentage of the amount contributed” shall be

substituted.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
Digitally signed by Salim A
Thisis adigitally signed Gazete. Date:2020.07.03 08:28:00 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




		2020-07-03T20:28:00+0530
	Salim A




